
BID 23025 Woody Invasive Plant Clearning

DUE 8/18/2023; 11:00 a.m.

NO. PRODUCT UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE UNIT PRICE EXT. PRICE

1

initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment; includes 

treatment of all individually marked trees for 

girdle/removal

acre 83.2  $                                -   $2,122.00  $                176,550.40  $                                -    $                                -   $5,800.00  $                482,560.00 $1,547.00  $                128,710.40  $                                -   

2 resprout treatment acre 83.2  $                                -   $1,120.00  $                  93,184.00  $                                -    $                                -   $1,800.00  $                149,760.00 $844.00  $                  70,220.80  $                                -   

3 brush removal acre 83.2  $                                -   $300.00  $                  24,960.00  $                                -    $                                -   $1,200.00  $                  99,840.00 $237.00  $                  19,718.40  $                                -   

4 resprout treatment only* acre 36.7  $                                -   $1,105.00  $                  40,553.50  $                                -    $                                -   $1,800.00  $                  66,060.00 $590.00  $                  21,653.00  $                                -   

NO BID 335,247.90$                NO BID NO BID 798,220.00$                240,302.60$                NO BID

1
initial clearing (only forestry mowing) & stump 

herbicide treatment
acre 13.8 $2,700.00  $                  37,260.00 $3,128.00  $                  43,166.40  $                                -   $2,135.00  $                  29,463.00 $4,500.00  $                  62,100.00 $1,324.00  $                  18,271.20  $                                -   

2 resprout treatment acre 13.8 $720.00  $                    9,936.00 $1,196.00  $                  16,504.80  $                                -   $1,160.00  $                  16,008.00 $1,800.00  $                  24,840.00 $826.00  $                  11,398.80  $                                -   

47,196.00$                  59,671.20$                  NO BID 45,471.00$                  86,940.00$                  29,670.00$                  NO BID

1

Thinning area:

initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment; includes 

treatment of all individually marked trees for 

girdle/removal

acre 10.8 $3,900.00  $                  42,120.00 $2,210.00  $                  23,868.00 $1,495.00  $                  16,146.00 $3,553.00  $                  38,372.40 $6,200.00  $                  66,960.00 $3,301.00  $                  35,650.80 $7,500.00  $                  81,000.00 

2 thinning area: brush removal acre 10.8 $500.00  $                    5,400.00 $300.00  $                    3,240.00 $600.00  $                    6,480.00 $879.00  $                    9,493.20 $1,200.00  $                  12,960.00 $837.67  $                    9,046.84 $4,333.33  $                  46,799.96 

3
mowing areas: initial clearing & stump herbicide 

treatment
acre 9.1 $2,400.00  $                  21,840.00 $2,400.00  $                  21,840.00 $1,394.00  $                  12,685.40 $1,813.00  $                  16,498.30 $4,500.00  $                  40,950.00 $1,798.00  $                  16,361.80 $3,000.00  $                  27,300.00 

4 resprout treatment acre 19.9 $720.00  $                  14,328.00 $1,168.00  $                  23,243.20 $300.00  $                    5,970.00 $545.00  $                  10,845.50 $1,800.00  $                  35,820.00 $552.00  $                  10,984.80 $1,683.42  $                  33,500.06 

83,688.00$                  72,191.20$                  41,281.40$                  75,209.40$                  156,690.00$                72,044.24$                  188,600.02$                

1

initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment; includes 

treatment of all individually marked trees for 

girdle/removal

acre 24.8 $3,900.00  $                  96,720.00 $2,146.00  $                  53,220.80  $                                -   $2,227.00  $                  55,229.60 $6,200.00  $                153,760.00 $3,123.00  $                  77,450.40  $                                -   

2 brush removal acre 24.8 $500.00  $                  12,400.00 $300.00  $                    7,440.00  $                                -   $1,205.00  $                  29,884.00 $1,200.00  $                  29,760.00 $822.00  $                  20,385.60  $                                -   

2 resprout treatment acre 24.8 $720.00  $                  17,856.00 $1,155.00  $                  28,644.00  $                                -   $828.00  $                  20,534.40 $1,800.00  $                  44,640.00 $769.00  $                  19,071.20  $                                -   

126,976.00$                89,304.80$                  NO BID 105,648.00$                228,160.00$                116,907.20$                NO BID

#VALUE! 556,415.10$                #VALUE! #VALUE! 1,270,010.00$             458,924.04$                #VALUE!
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